

CH. PERVAIZ ELAHI INSTITUTE OF CARDIOLOGY, MULTAN

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT (TECHNICAL) FOR THE PURCHASE OF DRUGS/MEDICINES FOR THE F.Y. 2022-23

S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Demand (Units)	Pack Size	Bidder / Supplier	Company / Manufacturer	Brand Name	5 th Past Performance of the Bidder (10 Marks)	Market Experience of Product (1.5 Marks)	Certification of Manufacturer (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (5 Marks)	Technical Staff (10 Marks)	Production Capacity (10 Marks)	Batch History (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 65)	Technical Status
Antispasmodics & Drugs Affecting GIT Motility															
1	Inj. Atropine 1mg/ml, 1ml	14,000		New Majeed Medicine Company	Brookes Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Inj. Neo-Pyrilate	10	10	7	5	4	5	5	46.00	*T.R
2	Inj. Neostigmine 2.5mg + Glycopyrrilate 0.5mg	2,000	10x1ml												
3	Syp. Hyoscine, 5mg/5ml	50													
4	Inj. Metoclopramide 5mg/ml, 2ml	50,000		Global Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Global Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Inj. Metoclopramide 10mg	10	10	7	5	2	5	5	44.00	*T.R
5	Tab. Domperidone, 10mg	2,500		Caraway Pharmaceuticals	Caraway Pharmaceuticals	Tab. Motidil 10mg	10	7	7	5	2	10	5	46.00	*T.R
6	Syp. Domperidone 5mg/5ml, 120ml	100													
7	Tab. Ondansetron (HCl), 8mg	100													
8	Inj. Ondansetron (HCl), 2mg/ml, 4ml	2,000	5's	Caraway Pharmaceuticals	Caraway Pharmaceuticals	Inj. Ondansetron 8mg	10	10	7	5	2	8	5	47.09	*T.R
9	Syp. Calcium Carbonate 160mg/10ml, Sodium Alginate 500mg/10ml, Sodium Bicarbonate 267mg/10ml, (120ml)	200													
10	Syp. Simethicon + Aluminium Hydroxide + Mg. Hydroxide + Carboxy Methyl Cellulose, 120ml	50													
Drugs for Ulcer: Healing & Reflux Oesophagitis															
11	Tab. Ranitidine, 150mg	2,100													
12	Inj. Ranitidine 25mg/ml, 2ml	1,000													
13	Inj. Omeprazole, 40mg	6,000	1's	Vision Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Vision Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Inj. Rapid 40mg IV	6	5	5	5	4	10	5	40.00	**T.N.R
				S.J. & G. Fazul Ellahi (Pvt) Ltd.	S.J. & G. Fazul Ellahi (Pvt) Ltd.	Inj. Vify 40mg	4	8	5	5	Irrelevant Docs Attached	10	5	37.00	**T.N.R
			1's	Bosch Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Bosch Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Inj. Omezol	10	15	7	5	4	10	5	56.00	*T.R
14	Inj. Esomeprazole, 40mg	200													
15	Cap. Omeprazole, 40mg	20,000	14's	Next Pharmaceutical Products (Pvt) Ltd.	Next Pharmaceutical Products (Pvt) Ltd.	Cap. Omecap 20mg	6	10	5	5	4	10	5	45.00	*T.R

N/P = Not Provided

*T.R = Technically Responsive

**T.N.R = Technically Non Responsive

S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Demand (Units)	Pack Size	Bidder / Supplier	Company / Manufacturer	Brand Name	Past Performance of the Bidder (10 Marks)	Market Experience of Product (15 Marks)	Certification of Manufacturer (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (5 Marks)	Technical Staff (10 Marks)	Production Capacity (10 Marks)	Batch History (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 65)	Technical Status
Drugs Acting on Cardiovascular System															
16	Tab. Digoxin 0.25mg	500,000					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
17	Inj. Digoxin 0.5mg/2ml, 2ml	5,500					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
18	Tab. Frusemide, 40mg	700,000	100's	Sanofi Aventis Pakistan Ltd.	Sanofi Aventis Pakistan Ltd.	Tab. Lasix 40mg	6	15	5	5	2	10	5	48.00	*T.R
19	Inj. Frusemide 20mg/ml, 2ml	150,000	50's	Sanofi Aventis Pakistan Ltd.	Sanofi Aventis Pakistan Ltd.	Inj. Lasix 2ml	6	15	5	5	2	10	5	48.00	*T.R
20	Tab. Spironolactone 50mg + Frusemide 20mg	800,000	20's	Jamil Traders Multan	The Searle Company Ltd.	Tab. Spiromide 20mg	10	15	5	5	2	10	5	52.00	*T.R
21	Tab. Spironolactone 50mg + Frusemide 40mg	3,500,000	30's	Jamil Traders Multan	The Searle Company Ltd.	Tab. Spiromide 40mg	10	15	5	5	2	10	5	52.00	*T.R
22	Tab. Frusemide 40mg + Amloride HCl, 5mg	700,000	30's	Sanofi Aventis Pakistan Ltd.	Sanofi Aventis Pakistan Ltd.	Tab. Lasoride	6	15	5	5	2	10	5	48.00	*T.R
23	Tab. Spironolactone, 100mg	5,000					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
24	Tab. Metolazone, 5mg	500					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
25	Inj. Adenosine 3mg/ml, 6ml	3,200					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
26	Tab. Amiodarone HCl, 200mg	40,000					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
27	Inj. Amiodarone Hydrochloride 150mg/ml, 3ml	14,000					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
28	Inj. Lignocain 2%, 10ml	20,000	50's	Surge Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Surge Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Inj. Lidocaine 2%	10	10	5	2	4	10	5	46.00	*T.R
29	Inj. Verapamil, 2.5mg/ml, 2ml	150					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
30	Tab. Atenolol, 50mg	10,000,000	30's	New Majed Medicine Company	Highnoon Laboratories Ltd.	Tab. Blokium 50mg	10	10	7	5	4	10	5	51.00	*T.R
			25x20's	Mega Pharmaceuticals Ltd.	Mega Pharmaceuticals Ltd.	Tab. ATL 50mg	10	10	7	5	4	8	5	49.00	*T.R
			140's	Nabi Qasim Industries (Pvt) Ltd.	Nabi Qasim Industries (Pvt) Ltd.	Tab. Normitab 50mg	6	15	7	5	2	10	5	50.00	*T.R
			20's	Benson Pharmaceuticals	Benson Pharmaceuticals	Tab. Cardi 50mg	10	3	7	5	2	8	5	40.00	**T.N.R
			2x7's	Ferozsons Laboratories Ltd.	Ferozsons Laboratories Ltd.	Tab. Atenorm 50mg	6	10	7	5	4	8	5	45.00	*T.R
31	Tab. Propranolol, 10mg	350,000					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
32	Tab. Carvedilol, 12.5mg (Scored)	2,000,000	30's	Nabi Qasim Industries (Pvt) Ltd.	Nabi Qasim Industries (Pvt) Ltd.	Tab. Carpro 12.5mg	6	15	7	5	2	5	5	45.00	*T.R

N/P = Not Provided

*T.R = Technically Responsive

**T.N.R = Technically Non Responsive

S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Demand (Units)	Pack Size	Bidder / Supplier	Company / Manufacturer	Brand Name	Past Performance of the Bidder (10 Marks)	Market Experience of Product (15 Marks)	Certification of Manufacturer (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (5 Marks)	Technical Staff (10 Marks)	Production Capacity (10 Marks)	Batch History (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 65)	Technical Status
94	Syp. Diphenhydramine 8mg/5ml + Aminophylline 32mg/5ml + Ammonium Chloride 30mg/5ml + Menthol 0.98mg/5ml, 120ml	100													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
95	Inj. Aminophylline, 25mg/ml	2,500													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
96	Syp. Acefylline 125mg/5ml, 120ml	100													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
97	Tab. Theophylline, 350mg	5,000													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
98	Tab. Doxofylline, 400mg	500	10's	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Tab. Agolix 400mg	10	7	5	5	4	8	5	44.00	*T.R
99	Beclomethasone Dipropionate 40mg + Salbutamol Sulphate 96.40mg Nebulizer Suspension	22,000													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
100	Inj. Pheniramine Maleate, 25mg/ml	2,500													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
101	Tab. Pheniramine maleate, 25mg	600													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
102	Tab. Desloratidine, 5mg	100													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
Drugs Acting on the Central Nervous System															
103	Inj. Valproic Acid, 500mg	150													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
104	Tab. Haloperidol, 1.5mg	50													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
105	Inj. Haloperidol, 5mg/ml	600													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
106	Inj. Levotiracetam, 500mg/5ml	400													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
107	Syp/Susp. Carbamazepine, 100mg/5ml	50													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
108	Cap. Pregabalin, 75mg	1,000	14's	Caraway Pharmaceuticals	Caraway Pharmaceuticals	Tab. Pre-Gax 75mg	10	7	7	5	2	10	5	46.00	*T.R
				Muller & Phipps Pakistan (Pvt) Ltd.	AGP Ltd.	Cap. Negrab 75mg	10	7	7	5	Irrelevant Docs Attached	10	5	44.00	*T.R
109	Inj. Diazepam 5mg/ml, 2ml	500													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
110	Tab. Alprazolam, 0.5mg	6,000													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
111	Tab. Bromazepam, 3mg	5,000													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
112	Tab. Clonazepam, 0.5mg	5,000													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender
113	Inj. Midazolam, 5mg/5ml	5,000													No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender

N/P = Not Provided

*T.R = Technically Responsive

**T.N.R = Technically Non Responsive

S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Demand (Units)	Pack Size	Bidder / Supplier	Company / Manufacturer	Brand Name	Past Performance of the Bidder (10 Marks)	Master Experience of Product (15 Marks)	Certification of Manufacturer (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (5 Marks)	Technical Staff (10 Marks)	Production Capacity (10 Marks)	Batch History (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 65)	Technical Status
209	Inj. Fentanyl, 0.05mg/ml, 5ml	1,500		Caraway Pharmaceuticals	Caraway Pharmaceuticals	Inj. Caralac 30mg/ml	10	7	7	5	2	10	5	46.00	*T.R
210	Inj. Ketorolac Trometamol 30mg/ml	10,000	5's	Hudson Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Hudson Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Inj. Torason 30mg/ml	10	5	5	5	4	10	5	44.00	*T.R
				Global Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Global Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Inj. Toralac 30mg	10	10	7	5	2	5	5	44.00	*T.R
211	Inj. Naloxone (HCL) 0.4mg/ml	50					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
212	Lignocain Gel 2%, 15gm	6,000					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
213	Lidocain Spray 2.4%	100					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								

Contrast Media (Non-Ionic)

214	Inj. Iopromide 300mg, 100ml	20,000	100ml	New Majeed Medicine Company	Bayer AG Germany	Inj. Ultravist 300	10	15	3	5	Not Provided	10	5	48.00	*T.R
215	Inj. Iohexol 350mg, 100ml	1,000		Punjab Medical Services	Onko Ilac Sanayi ve Tic. A.S. Turkey	Inj. Kopaq	10	12	5	5	Not Provided	10	5	47.00	*T.R

Dietary Supplements

216	Tab. Calcium, 1g	1,000					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
217	Tab. Folic Acid, 5mg	1,000					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
218	Tab. Iron Hydroxide Polymaltose (Chewable Tablets)	1,000					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								

219	Vitamin Supplement	2,000	30's	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Tab. Vit&Min Heart	10	Not Provided	5	5	4	5	5	34.00	**T.N.R
-----	--------------------	-------	------	------------------------------------	------------------------------------	--------------------	----	--------------	---	---	---	---	---	-------	---------

Others / Miscellaneous

220	Tab. Escitalopram (HBr), 5mg	100					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
221	Tab. Ethambutol 275mg + Isoniazid 75mg + Rifampicin 150mg + Pyrazinamide 400mg	400					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
222	Influenza Vaccin 15mcg (Prefilled Syringe)	1,000					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								
223	Inj. Methylprednisolone, 500mg	100					No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender								

N/P = Not Provided

*T.R = Technically Responsive

**T.N.R = Technically Non Responsive

S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Demand (Units)	Pack Size	Bidder / Supplier	Company / Manufacturer	Brand Name	Past Performance of the Bidder (10 Marks)	Market Experience of Product (15 Marks)	Certification of Manufacturer (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (5 Marks)	Technical Staff (10 Marks)	Production Capacity (10 Marks)	Batch History (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 65)	Technical Status
224	Tab. Prednisolone, 5mg	6,000	100's	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Tab. Iniflagic 5mg	10	Not Provided	5	5	4	10	5	39.00	**T.N.R
225	Inj. Piracetam, 1g/5ml	50													
226	Tab. Risperidone, 1mg	100													
227	Susp. Zinc Sulphate 20mg/5ml, 60ml	300													

No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender

No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender

No bid/quotation offered. Recommended for retender

Mr. Muhammad Ishtaq (Co-opted Member)
Hospital Pharmacist, CPEIC Multan

Dr. Fayyaz Ahmad Hashmi (Member)
APMO, Radiology Department, CPEIC Multan

Dr. Iftikhar Paras (Member)
Associate Professor of Cardiac Surgery, CPEIC Multan

Dr. Farhan Khan (Member)
Director Technical, CPEIC Multan

Dr. Mustafa Ali Siddiqui (Member)
Professor of Radiology, CPEIC Multan

Dr. Sohail Saleem (Member)
Assistant Professor of Cardiology, CPEIC Multan

Dr. M. Aamir Furqan (Co-opted Member)
Head of Anaesthesia & Critical Care, CPEIC Multan

Dr. Zahid Rafiq Butt (Member)
Associate Professor of Cardiology, CPEIC Multan

Dr. Shafqat Hussain
Associate Professor of Cardiac Surgery

Chairman Technical Evaluation Committee, CPEIC Multan

N/P = Not Provided

*T.R = Technically Responsive

**T.N.R = Technically Non Responsive