

CH. PERVAIZ ELAHI INSTITUTE OF CARDIOLOGY, MULTAN

Technical Evaluation of Bidders in Annual Tender for the Procurement of Drugs/Medicines for the F.Y. 2026-27

Compulsory Parameters

Sr.	Company / Bidder Name	2% Bid Security	Bidding Docs Signed	Authority Letter / Agency Agreement	Valid DML / Valid DSL	GMP / GMP Inspection Report	GMP Section Validity	WHO Prequ. / USFDA	DRC with Pack Size	1 Year Experience after DRC	Form 29 (SECP) / Form-C	Bio-Similarity Studies Data	Affidavit (Bid Form 8.6 of Bidding Docs)	Affidavit regarding Spur/Adult last 3 Yrs	Affidavit regarding Spur/Adult for Quoted Items	Affidavit regarding Non-Proseque by POCB for Spur/Adult	Affidavit regarding Non-Blacklist by CPEIC	Affidavit regarding Supply in Reefer Containers	Affidavit regarding Supply in Compli to SRO 470 (I) 2017	Affidavit for Acceptance of Tender Terms & Conditions	Tender Samples	Remarks of Technical Evaluation Committee
1	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Received	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	YES	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Yes	Eligible for further evaluation
2	Bosch Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Received	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	YES	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Yes	Eligible for further evaluation
3	Ferozsons Laboratories Ltd.	Received	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	YES	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Yes	Eligible for further evaluation
5	Hoechst Pakistan Ltd.	Received	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	YES	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Yes	Eligible for further evaluation
6	Kaizen Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Received	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	YES	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Yes	Eligible for further evaluation
7	Maple Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Received	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	YES	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Yes	Eligible for further evaluation
8	Next Pharmaceutical Products (Pvt) Ltd.	Received	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	YES	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Yes	Eligible for further evaluation
9	PharmEvo (Pvt) Ltd.	Received	Attached	Not Applicable	DML not Submitted	Attached	Attached	Not Applicable	x-Plended 10mg renewal expired	YES	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Yes	Ineligible for further evaluation
10	Pharmatec Pakistan	Received	Not Submitted	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Valmo Plus Renewal not attached	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Yes	Partially Eligible for further evaluation
11	Scilife Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Received	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	YES	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Yes	Eligible for further evaluation
12	Shazeb Pharmaceutical Industries Ltd.	Received	Attached	Not Applicable	Expired on 21.02.26	Attached	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	YES	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Yes	Ineligible for further evaluation
13	Tabros Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Received	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	yes	Attached	Not Applicable	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Attached	Yes	Eligible for further evaluation

Mr. Muhammad Ishtaq (Co.Opted Member)
Hospital Pharmacist, CPEIC Multan

Dr. Shumaila Kanwal Hashmi (Member)
Assistant Professor of Pathology, CPEIC Multan

Dr. Badar-ul-Ahad Gill (Member)
Associate Professor of Cardiology, CPEIC Multan

Dr. Barira Ahmad (Member)
Assistanat Prof. of Cardiac Surgery, CPEIC Multan

Dr. Syed Haseeb Raza Naqvi (Member)
Assistant Professor of Electrophysiology, CPEIC Multan

Dr. Muhammad Waqas Ch. (Member)
DMS (Technical), CPEIC Multan

Prof. Dr. Kashif Ali Hashmi
(Chairman Technical Evaluation Committee)
Professor of Cardiology, CPEIC, Multan

CH. PERVAIZ ELAHI INSTITUTE OF CARDIOLOGY, MULTAN
COMPARATIVE STATEMENT (TECHNICAL) FOR THE PROCUREMENT OF DRUGS/MEDICINES FOR THE F.Y. 2026-27

S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Estimated Demand (Units)	Offered Pack Size	Bidder / Manufacturer	Company / Manufacturer	Bidder Category	Brand Name	API Source of Quoted Item (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Pvt. Sector (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Public Sector (10 Marks)	Credibility & Certification of Manufacturer (15 Marks)	Affidavit regarding %age of Samples declared Sub-standard by DTL in last F.Y.	No. of Functional Stability Chamber (6 Marks)	Stability Studies + Primary Reference Standard (4 Marks)	Technical Staff of Manufacturing Unit (5 Marks)	Availability at Chain Pharmacies (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 80)	Technical Status (T.R / T.N.R)
Antispasmodics & Drugs Affecting GIT Motility																			
1	Inj. Atropine 1mg/ml, 1ml	20,000																	
																			No Bid Received on e-PADS.
2	Inj. Neostigmine 2.5mg + Glycopyrrolate 0.5mg	3,000																	
																			No Bid Received on e-PADS.
3	Inj. Metoclopramide 5mg/ml, 2ml	45,000																	
																			No Bid Received on e-PADS.
4	Tab. Domperidone, 10mg	3,000																	
																			No Bid Received on e-PADS.
5	Inj. Ondansetron (HCl), 2mg/ml, 4ml	4,000																	
																			No Bid Received on e-PADS.
Drugs for Ulcer Healing & Reflux Esophagitis																			
6	Inj. Omeprazole, 40mg	20,000																	
																			No Bid Received on e-PADS.
7	Cap. Omeprazole, 20mg	30,000																	
																			Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
8	Cap/Tab. Pantoprazole, 40mg	50,000	14's	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Glovar 40mg Tablet	5	10	10	Not Provided	9	5	Invalid Calibration Certificates attached	2	4	2	47	**T.N.R
9	Syp. Lactulose 3.35g/5ml, 120ml	800																	
																			No Bid Received on e-PADS.
Drugs Acting on Cardiovascular System																			
10	Tab. Digoxin 0.25mg	200,000																	
																			No Bid Received on e-PADS.
11	Inj. Digoxin 0.5mg/2ml, 2ml	20,000																	
																			No Bid Received on e-PADS.
12	Tab. Frusemide, 40mg	1,500,000																	
																			Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
13	Inj. Frusemide 20mg/ml, 2ml	200,000																	
																			No Bid Received on e-PADS.
14	Tab. Spironolactone 50mg + Frusemide 20mg	1,500,000																	
																			No Bid Received on e-PADS.
15	Tab. Spironolactone 50mg + Frusemide 40mg	5,000,000																	
																			No Bid Received on e-PADS.
16	Tab. Frusemide 40mg + Amiloride HCl, 5mg	1,200,000	30's	Hoechst Pakistan Ltd.	Hoechst Pakistan Ltd.	Local	Lasoride 40mg Tablet	5	10	10	10	12	5	6	1	5	5	69	*T.R
17	Tab. Spironolactone, 100mg	50,000																	
																			No Bid Received on e-PADS.
18	Tab Metolazone, 5mg	3,000																	
																			No Bid Received on e-PADS.
19	Inj. Adenosine 3mg/ml	5,000																	
																			Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender

*T.R = Technically Responsive

Qualifying Marks: 52 out of 80

**T.N.R = Technically Non-Responsive

S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Estimated Demand (Units)	Offered Pack Size	Bidder / Manufacturer	Company / Manufacturer	Bidder Category	Brand Name	API Source of Quoted Item (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Pvt. Sector (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Public Sector (10 Marks)	Credibility & Certification of Manufacturer (15 Marks)	Affidavit regarding %age of Samples declared Sub-standard by DTL in last F.Y.	No. of Functional Stability Chamber (6 Marks)	Stability Studies + Primary Reference Standard (4 Marks)	Technical Staff of Manufacturing Unit (5 Marks)	Availability at Chain Pharmacies (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 80)	Technical Status (T.R / T.N.R)
20	Tab. Amiodarone HCl, 200mg	6,000																	
21	Inj. Amiodarone Hydrochloride 150mg/ml, 3ml	30,000																	
22	Inj. Lignocaine 2%, 10ml	15,000																	
23	Inj. Verapamil, 2.5mg/ml, 2ml	8,000																	
24	Tab. Atenolol, 50mg	8,000,000	14's	Ferozs Laboratories Ltd.	Ferozs Laboratories Ltd.	Local	Atenorm 50mg Tablet	5	10	10	5	12	5	4	1	5	5	62	*T.R
25	Tab. Propranolol, 10mg	50,000																	
26	Tab. Carvedilol, 3.125mg	1,000,000	10's	Ferozs Laboratories Ltd.	Ferozs Laboratories Ltd.	Local	Carveda 3.125mg Tablet	5	10	10	3	12	5	4	1	5	5	60	*T.R
27	Tab. Carvedilol, 6.25mg (Scored)	4,000,000																	
28	Tab. Metoprolol, 50mg	20,000,000																	
29	Inj. Metoprolol Tartarate 1mg/ml, 5ml	5,000																	
30	Tab. Bisoprolol, 5mg	800,000																	
31	Tab. Nebivolol 5mg	150,000	28's	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Bynevol 5mg Tablet	5	10	10	Not Provided	9	5	6	3	5	5	58	*T.R
			14's	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Bysilol 5mg Tablet	5	10	10	Not Provided	9	5	Invalid Calibration Certificates attached	2	4	3	48	**T.N.R
			14's	Pharmatec Pakistan	Pharmatec Pakistan	Local	Nebtec 5mg Tablet	5	Not Provided	Irrelevant Data attached	Irrelevant Data attached	6	5	4	1	2	3	26	**T.N.R
			14's	PharmEvo (Pvt) Ltd.	PharmEvo (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Byvas 5mg Tablet	5	Tax Returns till 2023 only	10	Irrelevant PO's attached	12	5	6	2	4	5	49	**T.N.R
32	Tab. Ivabradine, 5mg	200,000	14's	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Noracor 5mg Tablet	5	10	10	Not Provided	9	5	6	3	5	5	58	*T.R
			14's	Kaizen Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Kaizen Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Ivable 5mg Tablet	5	10	10	Irrelevant PO's attached	12	5	4	Invalid Data provided	Not Provided	Not Provided	46	**T.N.R
		200,000	14's	Next Pharmaceutical Products (Pvt) Ltd.	Next Pharmaceutical Products (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Ivacard 5mg Tablet	5	7	10	10	9	5	4	4	Appointment Letters not attached	5	59	*T.R
33	Tab Bosentan Monohydrate, 62.5mg	5,000																	
34	Tab. Captopril, 25mg	100,000																	

*T.R = Technically Responsive

Qualifying Marks: 52 out of 80

*T.N.R = Technically Non-Responsive

S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Estimated Demand (Units)	Offered Pack Size	Bidder / Manufacturer	Company / Manufacturer	Bidder Category	Brand Name	API Source of Quoted Item (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Pvt. Sector (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Public Sector (10 Marks)	Credibility & Certification of Manufacturer (15 Marks)	Affidavit regarding %age of Samples declared Sub-standard by DTL in last F.Y.	No. of Functional Stability Chamber (6 Marks)	Stability Studies + Primary Reference Standard (4 Marks)	Technical Staff of Manufacturing Unit (5 Marks)	Availability at Chain Pharmacies (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 80)	Technical Status (T.R / T.N.R)
35	Tab. Lisinopril, 5mg	3,000,000	30's	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Lame 5mg Tablet	5	10	10	5	9	5	6	3	5	5	63	*T.R
			14's	Scilife Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Scilife Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Trupril 5mg Tablet	5	10	3	Not Provided	12	5	4	2	4	5	50	**T.N.R
36	Tab. Lisinopril, 10mg	1,000,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																
37	Tab. Losartan Potassium, 50mg	10,000,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																
38	Tab Valsartan , 80mg	1,000,000	28's	Scilife Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Scilife Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Valid 80mg Tablet	5	10	10	10	12	5	4	2	4	5	67	*T.R
			28's	Tabros Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Tabros Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Valtec 80mg Tablet	5	10	5	10	6	Not Provided	6	1	3	5	51	**T.N.R
			14's	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Dioplus 10/160mg Tablet	5	10	10	Not Provided	9	5	6	3	5	5	58	*T.R
39	Tab. Amlodipine 10mg+ Valsartan 160mg	2,000,000	28's	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Forgex 10/160mg Tablet	5	10	10	Not Provided	9	5	Invalid Calibration Certificates attached	2	4	2	47	**T.N.R
			14's	Next Pharmaceutical Products (Pvt) Ltd.	Next Pharmaceutical Products (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Velvet AM 10/160mg Tablet	5	7	10	Not Provided	9	5	4	4	Appointment Letters not attached	5	49	**T.N.R
			14's	Scilife Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Scilife Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Amstan 10/160mg Tablet	5	10	10	5	12	5	4	2	4	5	62	*T.R
40	Tab. Amlodipine 10mg+ Valsartan 160mg+Hydrochlorothiazide 12.5mg	250,000	28's	Pharmatec Pakistan	Pharmatec Pakistan	Local	Valmo Plus 10/160/12.5mg Tablet	5	Not Provided	Irrelevant Data attached	Irrelevant Data attached	6	5	4	1	2	3	26	**T.N.R
			28's	Scilife Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Scilife Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Co-Amstan 10+160+12.5 mg Tablet	5	10	10	5	12	5	4	2	4	5	62	*T.R
41	Tab. Sacubitril + Valsartan, 50mg	50,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																
42	Tab. Glyceryl Trinitrate, 0.5mg S/L	110,000	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
43	Tab. Glyceryl Trinitrate, 2.6mg	17,500,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																
44	Tab. Glyceryl Trinitrate, 6.4mg	14,000,000	30's	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Cardnit 6.4mg Tablet	5	10	10	Not Provided	9	5	6	3	5	5	58	*T.R
45	Inj. Glyceryl Trinitrate 1mg/ml, 10ml	5,000	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
46	Inj. Isosorbide Dinitrate, 10mg/10ml	20,000	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
47	Tab. Diltiazem, 30mg	3,000,000	30'S	Maple Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Maple Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Calzem 30 Tablet	5	10	10	3	12	5	4	1	1	5	56	*T.R
48	Tab. Diltiazem, 60mg	500,000	20's	Maple Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Maple Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Calzem S.R 60mg Tablet	5	10	10	10	12	5	4	1	1	5	63	*T.R

*T.R = Technically Responsive

Qualifying Marks: 52 out of 80

*T.N.R = Technically Non-Responsive

S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Estimated Demand (Units)	Offered Pack Size	Bidder / Manufacturer	Company / Manufacturer	Bidder Category	Brand Name	API Source of Quoted Item (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Pvt. Sector (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Public Sector (10 Marks)	Credibility & Certification of Manufacturer (15 Marks)	Affidavit regarding %age of Samples declared Sub-standard by DTL in last F.Y.	No. of Functional Stability Chamber (6 Marks)	Stability Studies + Primary Reference Standard (4 Marks)	Technical Staff of Manufacturing Unit (5 Marks)	Availability at Chain Pharmacies (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 80)	Technical Status (T.R / T.N.R)
49	Tab. Amlodipine, 5mg	8,500,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurment process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																
50	Tab. Ranolazine, 500mg	25,000	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
51	Tab. Nicorandil, 10mg	1,200	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
52	Tab. Trimetazidine, 35mg	50,000	20's	Next Pharmaceutical Products (Pvt) Ltd.	Next Pharmaceutical Products (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Trikat MR 35mg Tablet	5	7	10	10	9	5	4	4	Appointment Letters not attached	5	59	*T.R
53	Inj. Adrenaline 0.1% W/V, 1mg/ml, 1ml	30,000	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
54	Inj. Nor-Adrenaline 1mg/ml, 4ml	40,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurment process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																
55	Inj. Phenylephrine 10mg/ml, 1ml	1,500	5's	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Synephrine 10mg Injection	5	10	10	10	9	5	6	3	5		63	*T.R
56	Inj. Dopamine HCl, 200mg/5ml	8,000	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
57	Inj. Dobutamine HCl, 250mg/5ml	31,000	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
58	Inj. Milrinone Lactate, 10mg/10ml	1,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurment process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																
59	Inj. Protamine Sulphate, 10mg/ml	25,000	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
60	Inj. Tranexamic Acid 500mg/5ml, 5ml	7,500	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
61	Inj. Heparin 5000 IU/ml, 5ml	40,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurment process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																
62	Tab. Rivaroxban, 15mg	1,000	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
63	Tab. Warfarin, 5mg	800,000	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
64	Inj. Enoxaparin, 60mg	25,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurment process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																
65	Tab. Aspirin, 75mg (Enteric Coated)	23,000,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurment process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																
66	Tab. Aspirin, 300mg (Soluble)	500,000	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
67	Tab. Clopidogrel, 75mg	16,000,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurment process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																

S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Estimated Demand (Units)	Offered Pack Size	Bidder / Manufacturer	Company / Manufacturer	Bidder Category	Brand Name	API Source of Quoted Item (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Pvt. Sector (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Public Sector (10 Marks)	Credibility & Certification of Manufacturer (15 Marks)	Affidavit regarding %age of Samples declared Sub-standard by DTL in last F.Y.	No. of Functional Stability Chamber (6 Marks)	Stability Studies + Primary Reference Standard (4 Marks)	Technical Staff of Manufacturing Unit (5 Marks)	Availability at Chain Pharmacies (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 80)	Technical Status (T.R / T.N.R)
68	Tab. Ticagrelor, 90mg	300,000	20's	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Ticard 90mg Tablet	5	10	10	Not Provided	9	5	6	3	5	5	58	*T.R
			10's	Ferozsans Laboratories Ltd.	Ferozsans Laboratories Ltd.	Local	Tissara 90mg Tablet	5	10	10	10	12	5	4	1	5	5	67	*T.R
			20's	PharmEvo (Pvt) Ltd.	PharmEvo (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Anplag 90mg Tablet	5	Tax Returns till 2023 only	10	Irrelevant PO's attached	12	5	6	2	4	5	49	**T.N.R
			20's	Scilife Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Scilife Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Bilinta 90mg Tablet	5	10	10	Not Provided	12	5	4	2	4	5	57	*T.R
69	Inj. Tirofiban, 12.5mg/50ml	2,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																
70	Tab. Atorvastatin, 20mg	1,000,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																
71	Tab. Rosuvastatin, 10mg	23,000,000	10's	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Atco Laboratories (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Rovator 10mg Tablet	5	10	<25% of Total Advertised Qty	Not Provided	9	5	6	3	5	5	48	**T.N.R
			30's	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Rosuvast 10mg Tablet	5	10	10	Not Provided	9	5	Invalid Calibration Certificates attached	2	4	5	50	**T.N.R
			15's	Scilife Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Scilife Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Kestore 10mg Tablet	5	10	7	3	12	5	4	2	4	5	57	*T.R
			100's	Tabros Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Tabros Pharma (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Rast 10mg Tablet	5	10	Not Provided	PO's older than last 2 years	6	Not Provided	6	1	3	5	36	**T.N.R
			10'S	PharmEvo (Pvt) Ltd.	PharmEvo (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Xplended 10mg Tablet	5	Tax Returns till 2023 only	10	Irrelevant PO's attached	12	5	6	2	4	5	49	**T.N.R
72	Inj. Streptokinase, 1.5 MIU	2,400	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																

Drugs Acting on the Respiratory System

73	Soln. Ipratropium Bromide 0.25%,	36,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																
74	Tab. Montelukast, 10mg	1,200	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
75	Acetylcysteine 200mg/Sachet	1,200	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
76	Rotacap Budesonide + Formoterol, 400/6 mcg	3,000	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
77	Rotacap Tiotropium, 18mcg	3,000	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																
78	Soln. Beclomethasone 0.8mg/2ml	36,000	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender																
79	Budesonide 100mcg + Formoterol 6mcg Inhaler	2,000	No Bid Received on e-PADS.																

S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Estimated Demand (Units)	Offered Pack Size	Bidder / Manufacturer	Company / Manufacturer	Bidder Category	Brand Name	API Source of Quoted Item (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Pvt. Sector (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Public Sector (10 Marks)	Credibility & Certification of Manufacturer (15 Marks)	Affidavit regarding %age of Samples declared Sub-standard by DTL in last F.Y.	No. of Functional Stability Chamber (6 Marks)	Stability Studies + Primary Reference Standard (4 Marks)	Technical Staff of Manufacturing Unit (5 Marks)	Availability at Chain Pharmacies (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 80)	Technical Status (T.R / T.N.R)
80	Beclomethasone Dipropionate 100mcg + Formoterol Fumarate Dihydrate 6mcg Inhaler	1,440		Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender															
81	Inj. Aminophylline, 25mg/ml	7,200		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															
82	Syp Acefylline 125mg/5ml, 120ml	500		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															
83	Tab. Doxofylline, 400mg	7,200	10's	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Hiranis Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Agolix 400mg Tablet	5	10	10	Not Provided	9	5	Invalid Calibration Certificates attached	2	4	2	47	**T.N.R
			20's	Kaizen Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Kaizen Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd.	Local	Profylline 400mg Tablet	5	10	10	Irrelevant PO's attached	12	5	4	Invalid Data provided	Not Provided	1	47	**T.N.R
84	Inj. Pheniramine Maleate, 25mg/ml	5,000		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															

Drugs Acting on the Central Nervous System

85	Inj. Valproic Acid, 500mg	1,200		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															
86	Inj. Haloperidol, 2.5mg/ml	2,000		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															
87	Inj. Levetiracetam, 500mg/5ml	1,800		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															
88	Tab. Bromazepam, 3mg	15,675		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															
89	Inj. Midazolam, 5mg/5ml	20,000		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															

Drugs used in the Treatment of Infections (Antibacterial Drugs)

90	Inj. Benzyl Penicillin, 10 Lac units	20,000		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															
91	Tab Amoxicillin + Clavulanic Acid, 625mg	25,000	12's	Bosch Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd	Bosch Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd	Local	Calamox 625mg Tablet	5	10	10	10	9	5	6	4	4	Valid Invoices Not Provided	63	*T.R
92	Inj. Cephadrine, 500mg	3,600		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															
93	Cap. Cefixime, 400mg	1,000		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															
94	Susp.Cefixime, 100mg/5ml	200		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															
95	Inj. Cefoperazone Sodium + Sulbactam, 1g	20,000	1's	Bosch Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd	Bosch Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd	Local	Cebac 1g Injection	5	10	10	Irrelevant PO's attached	9	5	6	4	4	Valid Invoices Not Provided	53	*T.R
96	Inj. Cefoperazone Sodium + Sulbactam, 2g	5,000		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															
97	Inj. Ceftriaxone, 1g with Distilled Water	40,000		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															
98	Inj. Amikacin, 500mg	10,000		No Bid Received on e-PADS.															

*T.R = Technically Responsive

Qualifying Marks: 52 out of 80

*T.N.R = Technically Non-Responsive

S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Estimated Demand (Units)	Offered Pack Size	Bidder / Manufacturer	Company / Manufacturer	Bidder Category	Brand Name	API Source of Quoted Item (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Pvt. Sector (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Public Sector (10 Marks)	Credibility & Certification of Manufacturer (15 Marks)	Affidavit regarding %age of Samples declared Sub-standard by DTL in last F.Y.	No. of Functional Stability Chamber (6 Marks)	Stability Studies + Primary Reference Standard (4 Marks)	Technical Staff of Manufacturing Unit (5 Marks)	Availability at Chain Pharmacies (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 80)	Technical Status (T.R / T.N.R)
99	Inj. Gentamicin, 80mg/ml, 2ml	3,600																	
100	Inj. Piperacillin 4g + Tazobactam 0.5g	12,500																	
101	Inj. Vancomycin, 500mg	5,000																	
102	Inj. Vancomycin, 1gm	10,000																	
103	Inj. Ciprofloxacin, 200mg/100ml	600																	
104	Tab. Moxifloxacin, 400mg	1,000																	
105	Inj. Moxifloxacin, 400mg/250ml	5,000																	
106	Tab. Linezolid, 600mg	800																	
107	Inj. Linezolid, 600mg/300ml	5,000																	
108	Inj. Imipenem 500mg + Cilastatin (Na) 500mg	2,000																	
109	Inj. Meropenem, 500mg	7,500	1's	Bosch Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd	Bosch Pharmaceuticals (Pvt) Ltd	Local	Penro 500mg Injection	5	10	10	5	9	5	6	3	4	Valid Invoices Not Provided	57	*T.R
110	Inj. Meropenem, 1g	500																	
111	Inj. Metronidazole, 500mg/100ml	1,200																	

Drugs used in the Treatment of Endocrine System Disorders

112	Inj. Insulin (Regular), 100 IU/ml, 10ml	3,000																	
113	Inj. Insulin 70/30, 100 IU/ml, 10ml	300																	
114	Tab. Glimepiride, 2mg	500,000																	
115	Tab. Metformin HCl, 500mg	50,000																	
116	Tab. Metformin 500mg + Sitagliptin 50mg	50,000																	
117	Inj. Hydrocortisone Sodium Succinate, 250mg	40,000																	
118	Inj. Dexamethasone 4mg/ml, 1ml	10,000																	

Drugs Affecting Nutrition & Blood

119	Inj. Magnesium Sulphate 50%, 500mg/ml	10,000																	
-----	---------------------------------------	--------	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--

S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Estimated Demand (Units)	Offered Pack Size	Bidder / Manufacturer	Company / Manufacturer	Bidder Category	Brand Name	API Source of Quoted Item (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Pvt. Sector (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Public Sector (10 Marks)	Credibility & Certification of Manufacturer (15 Marks)	Affidavit regarding %age of Samples declared Sub-standard by DTL in last F.Y.	No. of Functional Stability Chamber (6 Marks)	Stability Studies + Primary Reference Standard (4 Marks)	Technical Staff of Manufacturing Unit (5 Marks)	Availability at Chain Pharmacies (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 80)	Technical Status (T.R / T.N.R)
120	Tab. Potassium Chloride, 500mg	3,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
121	Inj. Potassium Chloride, 7.45% w/v, 20ml OR 25ml	36,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
122	Inj. Sodium Bicarbonate 8.4% w/v, 20ml OR 25ml	36,000																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
123	Inf. Polygeline/Gelatin Solutions	1,500																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
124	Inj. Cardioplegia, 10ml	6,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
125	Dextrose Water 5%, 1000ml	2,000																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
126	Dextrose Water 25%, 25ml or 20ml	40,000																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
127	Dextrose Water 25%, 1000ml	1,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
128	Normal Saline 0.9%, 100ml	40,000	100ml	Shazeb Pharmaceutical Industries Ltd.	Shazeb Pharmaceutical Industries Ltd.	Local	Zeesol-NS 100ml	5	10	Not Provided	PO's older than last 2 years	9	5	2	1	3	Not Provided	35	**T.N.R
129	Normal Saline 0.9%, 500ml	75,000	500ml	Shazeb Pharmaceutical Industries Ltd.	Shazeb Pharmaceutical Industries Ltd.	Local	Zeesol-NS 500ml	5	10	10	PO's older than last 2 years	9	5	2	1	3	Not Provided	45	**T.N.R
130	Normal Saline 0.9%, 1000ml	8,000																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
131	Ringer Lactate Solution, 1000ml	3,000																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
132	Dextrose 4.3% + Sodium Chloride 0.18% IV Solution, 500ml	5,000																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
133	Soln. Calcium Gluconate 10%, 10ml	10,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
134	Inj. Calcium Chloride 20% w/v, 200mg/ml	5,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
135	Inf. Mannitol 20%, 500ml	3,000																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
136	Amino Acids Infusion, 500ml	100																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
137	Inj. Albumin (Human) 20%, 50ml	600																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
Drugs used in the Treatment of Musculoskeletal & Joint (anti-inflammatory drugs)																			
138	Tab. Paracetamol, 500mg	500,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
139	Inf. Paracetamol, 1g/100ml	25,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.

*T.R = Technically Responsive

Qualifying Marks: 52 out of 80

T.N.R = Technically Non-Responsive

S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Estimated Demand (Units)	Offered Pack Size	Bidder / Manufacturer	Company / Manufacturer	Bidder Category	Brand Name	API Source of Quoted Item (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Pvt. Sector (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Public Sector (10 Marks)	Credibility & Certification of Manufacturer (15 Marks)	Affidavit regarding %age of Samples declared Sub-standard by DTL in last FY.	No. of Functional Stability Chamber (6 Marks)	Stability Studies + Primary Reference Standard (4 Marks)	Technical Staff of Manufacturing Unit (5 Marks)	Availability at Chain Pharmacies (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 80)	Technical Status (T.R / T.N.R)
140	Tab. Diclofenac Sodium SR, 100mg	25,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
141	Tab. Diclofenac Potassium, 50mg	50,000																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurment process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
142	Tab Naproxen Sodium, 500mg	10,000																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurment process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
Drugs Acting on the Skin																			
143	Topical Soln. Povidone-Iodine 10%, 450ml	3,600																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurment process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
144	Povidone Iodine Scrub, 450ml	1,200																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurment process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
145	Methylated Spirit (Liters)	3,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
146	Soda Lime	100																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
Drugs Used in Anaesthesia																			
147	Inj. Ketamine HCl, 100mg/2ml	3,800																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
148	Inj. Propofol 1%, 10mg/ml	7,000																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurment process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
149	Inj. Dexmedetomidine 100mcg/ml, 2ml	50																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
150	Inhalation Solution Isoflurane, 100ml or 250ml	1,500																	Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurment process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender
151	Inj. Atracurium Besylate 10mg/ml, 5ml	12,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
152	Inj. Cisatracurium 2mg/ml, 5ml	2,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
153	Inj. Rocuronium Bromide, 50mg/5ml	1,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
154	Inj. Suxamethonium / Succinyl Choline, 100mg/2ml	7,200																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
155	Inj. Nalbuphine HCL, 10mg/ml	35,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
156	Inj. Morphine Sulphate, 15mg/ml	1,800																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
157	Inj. Fentanyl, 0.05mg/ml, 5ml	1,400																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
158	Inj. Ketorolac Trometamol 30mg/ml	5,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
159	Lignocaine Gel 2%, 15gm	15,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.
160	Lidocaine Spray 2.4%	72																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.

Drugs / Medicines Tender for the F.Y. 2026-27																				Page 10 of 10
S#	Drugs / Medicines with Specifications	Estimated Demand (Units)	Offered Pack Size	Bidder / Manufacturer	Company / Manufacturer	Bidder Category	Brand Name	API Source of Quoted Item (10 Marks)	Financial Status of Bidder (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Pvt. Sector (10 Marks)	Quoted Product Experience in Public Sector (10 Marks)	Credibility & Certification of Manufacturer (15 Marks)	Affidavit regarding %age of Samples declared Sub-standard by DTL in last F.Y.	No. of Functional Stability Chamber (6 Marks)	Stability Studies + Primary Reference Standard (4 Marks)	Technical Staff of Manufacturing Unit (5 Marks)	Availability at Chain Pharmacies (5 Marks)	Obtained Marks (Out of 80)	Technical Status (T.R / T.N.R)	
161	Inj. Bupivacaine HCl 0.5%, 5mg/ml	600																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.	
162	Lignocaine Dental Cart, Without Adrenaline, 2%	3,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.	
Contrast Media (Non-Ionic)																				
163	Inj. Iohexol 350mg, 100ml	32,000			Advertised by SHC&MED Lahore in Central Procurement Tender. SHC&MED vide letter No. SO(P-I)H/1-10/2026-27 dated: 09.04.2026 directed to desist from initiating procurement process of those items which were advertised in Central Tender															
Others / Miscellaneous																				
164	Inj. Methylprednisolone, 500mg	600																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.	
165	Tab. Prednisolone, 5mg	6,000																	No Bid Received on e-PADS.	


Mr. Muhammad Ishfaq (Co-opted Member)
 Hospital Pharmacist, CPEIC Multan


Dr. Shumaila Kanwal Hashmi (Member)
 Assistant Professor of Pathology, CPEIC Multan


Dr. Barira Ahmad (Member)
 Assistant Professor of Cardiac Surgery, CPEIC Multan


Dr. Muhammad Waqas Ch. (Member)
 DMS (Technical), CPEIC Multan


Dr. Syed Haseeb Raza Naqvi (Member)
 Assistant Professor of Electrophysiology, CPEIC Multan


Dr. Badar-ul-Ahad Gill (Member)
 Associate Professor of Cardiology, CPEIC Multan


Prof. Dr. Hashif Ali Hashmi
 Professor of Cardiology
 Chairman Technical Evaluation Committee, CPEIC Multan